
From: "John P. Woods"
To: mjeffrey E."' leevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: FW: Invoice 
Date: Wed, 08 Feb 2017 18:43:53 +0000 

Attachments: 27Jan17_GreatStJames_TimeSheets,Inv.No._16-011.2 _JDG.PDF 

Sorry. Here is the invoice. 

JPW 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 8, 2017 12:53 PM 
To: John P. Woods 
Subject: Re: FW: Invoice 

there is no invoice 

On Wed, Feb 8, 2017 at 12:47 PM, John P. Woods < > wrote: 
Mr. Kahn, 

Have you reviewed the attached invoice, transmitted on January 30, 2017? 

JPW 

 Original Message 
From: John P. Woods [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, January 30, 2017 2:50 PM 
To: 'jeffrey E.' 
Cc: 'Richard Kahn; 'Darren Indyke; 'Erika Kellerhals' 
Subject: Invoice 

Attached is the Jaredian Design Group's invoice for services provided 
between December 17, 2016 - January 27, 2017. Most of the work was 
associated with revising and resubmitting the design drawings at the request 
of CZM, removing the Phase 2 scope. I do not anticipate the need for 
services to be provide until the Notice To Cure is resolved. 

JPW 

This email has been checked for viruses by Avast antivirus software. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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