
From: Richard Joslin -4 

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Artspace - Execution version of APA 

Date: Tue, 12 Aug 2014 21:31:. +0000 

Attachments: Additional_Supply_Contracts.xlsx; ArtSpace_-
Asset Purchase_Agreement_(PW_Aug_12)-v10.doc 

I am going to ask Heather about 1031 and related party/dealer "issue" 

From: John Murphy [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, August 12, 2014 5:09 PM 
To: Larsen, Sonia; Keith Fox; Lakhdhir, David K 
Cc: Eileen Alexanderson; Richard Joslin 
Subject: RE: Artspace - Execution version of APA 

Hi Sonia, 

Please find a list of the additional Supply Partnership contracts. 

Regards, 

John. 

From: Larsen, Sonia [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, August 12, 2014 4:50 PM 
To: Keith Fox; John Murphy; Lakhdhir, David K 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Artspace - Execution version of APA 

Perfect. Will send to Ron once John confirms the list of agreements. 

Sonia Larsen I Associate 
Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison LLP 
Alder Castle 10 Noble Street London EC2V 7JU, U.K. 

(Direct Phone) 

From: Keith Fox imailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, August 12, 2014 04:29 PM Eastern Standard Time 
To: Larsen Sonia* John Mur h < >• Lakhdhir, David K 
Cc: < >; Richard Joslin 

Subject: RE: Artspace - Execution version of APA 

Here is the signed copy. Keith 

Keith Fox 
CEO 

EFTA00707616



Phaidon 
65 Bleecker Street. 8th FL 
New York, NY 10012 

T 

From: Larsen, Sonia [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, August 12, 2014 3:37 PM 
To: John Murphy; Lakhdhir, David K 
Cc: ; Keith Fox; Richard Joan ( 
Subject: Artspace - Execution version of APA 

Attached please find the execution version of the agreement that we agreed with Ron (clean and blakcline against the last 
draft). The change is in Exhibit A and is just a clarification. 

Ron mentioned that they are still reviewing the list of contracts. Subject to this caveat, the agreement is in final form and 
we should get signatures from Keith. 

The deposit has been wired to Pillsbury's account. 

Best, 

Sonia Larsen I Associate 
Paul, Weiss, Rif kind, Wharton & Garrison LLP 
Alder Castle, 10 Noble Street London EC2V 7JU, U.K. 
+44 20 7367 1610 (Direct Phone) 

This message is intended only for the use of the Addressee and may contain information that is privileged and 
confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination of this 
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please erase all copies of 
the message and its attachments and notify us immediately. 
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