
From: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: '==" 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

Date: Sat, 21 Apr 2012 07:49:38 +0000 

That agreement can set aside the settlement . It is a part of it . Where is the 175k from elite 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 20, 2012, at 8:37 PM, " a wrote: 

> Theres another agreement between imads company 'new amsterdam investment' and mine, regarding Elite 

> Thats the one that will get translated this weekend 

> Thanks for your help 
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> 
> <Settlement Agreement.pdf> 
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