
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: St. Bart's balance - Peggy 
Date: Thu, 28 Apr 2011 12:50:47 +0000 

Attachments: PSI 1102 HBRK_StBartBalance.pdf 

Attached is invoice for $8,000 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Deanna Romeo" <deanna@peggysiegal.com>
Date: April 28, 2011 5:35:07 AM EDT 
To: <rkahn@hbrkassociates.com>
Cc: <RKahn@nysgmail.com>
Subject: St. Bart's balance 

Good morning Rich, 

I hope this e-mails finds you well! 

I asked in my last e-mail how you wanted me to submit the remaining balance from Peggy's St. Bart's trip since I know Jeffrey said he 
would take care of it. I went ahead and marked up an invoice for the remaining balance and have attached it for your convenience. Please 
let me know if you would like me to many any adjustments. 

Many thanks! 

Deanna M. Romeo 
waggingtail entertainment limited 
Peggy Siegal Inc. 
900 Broadway, Suite 400 
New York, NY 10003 

750 Lexington Avenue, 5th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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