
From: Lesley Groff 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: flight for Asiya 

Date: Wed, 05 Apr 2017 22:10:42 +0000 

Latest flight tomorrow: Royal Air Maroc departs 4:10pm into Orly 8:15pm Non Refundable fare $211.40...we 
are holding the ticket...unfortunately the agent can't tell how long the ticket can be held for at the moment...he 
said he will check in a couple of hours to see if airline has emailed him back. I will follow up... 

Rec. Loc PQYGHM 

On Apr 5, 2017, at 5:52 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Reserve a seat on the last flight tomorw from Marrakech to Paris for asiya 
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