
From: 

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Wed, 20 Apr 2016 22:11:45 +0000 

Ok, thank you. All good. I'm in contact with Bella and she covered the deposit for 
Thank you so much. I'm very happy to do the LLM at a 
So you won't be in Paris soon Jeffrey? 

Kind r rds, 

On 20 Apr 2016, at 4:40 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

they both work for me, i have not followed the issue, whats up 

On Wed, Apr 20, 2016 at 10:30 AM, 
Hi Jeffrey! 

Bella contacted me. Is she your assistant? Who is Richard ? 

Kind re ards, 
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campus already. 

> wrote: 
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