
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Agency; statement attached 
Date: Wed, 26 Jul 2017 21:14:59 +0000 

Ok, I understand, sorry for my stupid answer to you. 
I sent the question, waiting for email with response 

On Wed, Jul 26, 2017 at 5:02 PM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
ask for their answers in writing thats why i said send . NOT TALK 

On Wed, Jul 26, 2017 at 4:54 PM, > wrote: 
I used to talk about it. I got the answer. There are some excuses..: 
1-That it's client from another country , and they often pay straight before the next show. They have show 
only once per year, so III get money from them probably only in October. The agency sent them request but 
still waiting for the answer. 
2- money from other show I've to wait during 6 month 
3- "Natori" already paid but the agency need one month to take the money, so I'll get money during the first 
week of August only. ( not sure will I get it, or they 11 take it like money from my avance payment (3000$) 
that U waiting for now) 

On Wed, Jul 26, 2017 at 4:27 PM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
send . I see from the statement that it appears that some c;lients have not paid though the job was last 
year, is that correct. ? 

On Wed, Jul 26, 2017 at 4:02 PM, > wrote: 
They sent me this statement. 
I waiting for statement with all a ments that I've got from which show. 

waiting for call back from and direct deposit through my Chase account with advance ( 
max. LI be 3000$) payment cause non of the clients on the last list didn't pay yet. 
I 11 work every day untill 4 of august and then can take a weekend until 20 of august, cause there 11 be 
fashion week castings, that I should do. 
Tomorrow I'll work for 400$ from 9 am till 1 pm. Showroom... 
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