
From: 
To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 02 May 2012 00:23:58 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Jeffrey, 
If memory serves correct, Reenstra got his commission direct from sikorsky, so we would have never seen that 
number, I had this conversation some time ago with Howard German when I asked him why Reestra gets a 
commission again since we where duplicating the second S76 from them, Howard informed me it was because 
our NY office was in Reenstra's sikorsky's sales territory and would couldn't do anything to change that, I'm sure 
his commish was built into our purchase price, so we paid no matter what! 
Darren should have clsoing papers from both S76 purchases, but I'm pretty sure they would not show Reenstras 
money, since sikorksy paid him, to the best of my knowledge. 
Hope this helps 
Thx 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Tue, 1 May 2012 19:11:43 -0400 
To: Ivjet<1 
Subject: 

lany, george reenstra now says that he recieved 250k each time we bougt something from sikorsky„ my 
memory might be faulty , but i thought we had this dicsussion and that he had maintainted that he only 
represented us. ? did we also pay him 
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