
From: "Tonja Haddad Coleman" < 
To: "'Jeffrey Epstein"' <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: July Invoice 
Date: Tue, 21 Aug 2012 18:40:53 +0000 

Thank you- I was sure you had no idea. 
I have been asking Darren since last month, as your accountant has never put money into the Trust 
Account as required by our agreement. 
Have a good day and thank you again. 

Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
TONJA HADDAD, ■. 
Justice Building 
524 South Andrews Avenue 
Suite 200 North 
Fort La d rdale, Florida 33301 

facsimile 

Please note that as of September 1, 2012 our new address will be: 

Advocate Building 
315 SE 7th Street 
Suite 301 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 

facsimile 

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If 
you are not the intended recipient. you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If 
you are not the intended recipient. please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtoleevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, August 21, 2012 2:39 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: July Invoice 

he is on vacation , i will get on it 

On Tue, Aug 21, 2012 at 2:37 PM, Tonja Haddad Coleman < wrote: 
Darren: 
We are 3 weeks into this and I am not receiving any response regarding our invoices. Please advise at 
once, as we are now 21 days past due. It is unfair and unrealistic to expect our firm (which as you 
know is very small) to work without money in the Trust Account against which we can bill, and to 
front costs, travel, expenses, and the like, and not be reimbursed as required. 

EFTA00713699



Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
TONJA HADDAD, P.A. 
Justice Building 
524 South Andrews Avenue 
Suite 200 North 

Florida 33301 

acsimile 

Please note that as of September 1, 2012 our new address will be: 

Advocate Building 

315 SE 7th Street 
Suite 301 

e, FL 33301 

facsimile 

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If 
you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If 
you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message. 

From: Tonja Haddad Coleman [mailto:I 
Sent: Friday, August 17, 2012 9:50 AM 
To: 'Richard Kahn'• 'Darren Indyke' 
Cc: 
Subject: FW: July Invoice 
Importance: High 

Please advise at once as to the status of this invoice. Because you are not keeping the money in our Trust 
Account against which we can bill, as is required by our retainer agreement and is standard in the legal industry, 
we required payment upon receipt of this invoice, which was now 3 weeks ago. 
I really do not want this to be an issue every month, as I do not like chasing down money from clients. There is 
a lot to do in the next few months on this case and as such we are going to require that the retainer agreement 
requisite of funds in our Trust Account against which we can bill be enforced. 

Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
TONJA HADDAD, P.A. 
Justice Building 
524 South Andrews Avenue 
Suite 200 North 
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301 

acsimile 

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If 
you are not the intended recipient you are hereby notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If 
you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message. 

EFTA00713700



From: Tonja Haddad Coleman [mailto:I 
Sent: Monday, July 30, 2012 11:16 AM 
To: 'Richard Kahn'• 'Darren Indyke' 
Cc: 
Subject: July Invoice 
Importance: High 

Good day-
Please see attached invoice and note that because you are not keeping the money in our Trust Account against 
which we can bill, we are requesting payment upon receipt of this invoice. I tried to break things down into 
smaller, more detailed work as requested, and Jeffrey is aware that Debbie and I have about 90 hours in on 
researching and drafting the response to the Summary Judgment and the undisputed facts. 
Of course, feel free to call me if you have any questions at all. 

Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
TONJA HADDAD, P.A. 
Justice Building 
524 South Andrews Avenue 
Suite 200 North 
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301 

acsimile 

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If 
you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any review. dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If 
you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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