From: Brad Wechsler <[ R
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: Fw: Paying Premium for 1992 Insurance Trust

Date: Wed, 21 Oct 2015 14:358:41 +0000

Let me try again...(2 minutes)
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacationia/gmail.com=>
Date: Wed, 21 Oct 2015 10:23:18 -0400

To: Brad Wechsler<||

Subject: Re: Fw: Paying Premium for 1992 Insurance Trust

not enough info adas attahment not included

On Wed, Oct 21, 2015 at 9:51 AM, Brad Wechsler <[ - ' otc:

Sorry...meant to send the below to vou...
Sent from my Venizon Wireless BlackBerry

From:

Date: Wed, 21 Oct 2015 13:25:07 +0000
To: Ada Clapp= o
ReplyTo:

Subject: Re: Paying Premium for 1992 Insurance Trust

Jeffrev-since this office doesn't handle gift returns and ada feels payving the premium involves a gift (See Bl of
attached memo) [ wanted to make sure vou were in the loop. Any particular follow-up?
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

From: Ada Clapp < =
Date: Mon, 19 Oct 2015 17:17:08 0000

To: John Castrucci<
Ce: Samantha Proietto=

= Joe Avantario= =
= Richard Joslin= =: Brad

Subject: Paying Premium for 1992 Insurance Trust

As you may know, we are helping Barry with the administration of the 1992 Insurance Trust, which involves
assisting with the premium payments on the Hartford Life insurance policy held in the Trust. Please review
the attached memorandum outlining the procedures we should follow in connection with the premium
payment.

Please Note that the premium ins Due October 28™ and Samantha is following up with Frank Crystal & Co.

to get a new invoice with the correct amount to be paid. Accounting should also follow the attached procedures
with respect to this payment.

Please let me know if yvou have any questions regarding the procedures.

EFTA00714238



Best regards,

Ada Clapp

Chief Legal Officer
Elysium Management LLC
445 Park Avenue

Suite 1401

New York, New York 10022

Direct Dial: _

This communication and any attachment is for the intended recipient(s) only and may contain
information that is privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are not the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that further dissemination of this communication and its attachments 1s prohibited. Please
delete all copies of this communication and its attachments and notify me immediately that you have received

them in error. Thank vou.

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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