From: Nina K. <1 -

To: leffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: RE:
Date: Tue, 20 Oct 2015 18:15:23 +0000
Importance: Normal

Hello Jeffrey.

They told me that they needed to check with the firm because they had previously agreed on 35 a month so 105

for 3 months.

They told me to wait because they first want to clanfy the story with the fees before you make the transfer.

They also say that it's the lawyers that are going to sign the contract.
[ think they'll get back to me tomorrow or before the end of this week.

Best,

Nina

Date: Tue, 20 Oct 2015 14:07:12 -0400
Subject:
From: jeevacation@gmail.com

To: I
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