
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sun, 21 Jun 2015 02:55:57 +0000 

Tomorrow Noon? 

Thank you 

On Jun 20, 2015, at 9:35 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

we should pay the school directly for tax purposes or just give you a check. . . could you see if she is free 
tomorw afternoon? 

On Sat, Jun 20, 2015 at 5:53 PM, wrote: 
Hello! Thank you! Yes we need pay for school, full tuition $3660.15. Do you still have my account info or 
should I send it? 
Her name is MO))) her phone number I'm glad you like her! She said she had fun 
Thank you 

On Jun 20, 2015, at 1:33 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

do we need to pay for school in sept soon? can you send me natasha contact? . you looked great. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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