
From: Richard Kahn

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

Subject: giacometti 

Date: Thu, 23 Mar 2017 22:07:11 +0000 

i spoke with heather and she expects to have christies estimate from her contact tomorrow 
sotheby's will need to see in paris and will have estimate next tuesday or thursday. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Mar 23, 2017, at 2:03 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Ask heather for an auction estimate on the Giacometti Gagosian bull 
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