
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 
Date: Fri, 15 Sep 2017 20:30:56 +0000 

Attachments: Alpha_Group_Invoice_18sep17.pdf 

paul has secured nicole as a client at 250k per year beginning oct 1 
accordingly our 500k from STC goes to 250k 

on attached invoice paul used 500 as annual rate for sep 18-30 which probably is not fair but at the same time he 
has been trading for past 3 months for free 
please advise if ok to pay 78,938 on monday from STC 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Paul Barrett
Subject: Invoice 
Date: September 15, 2017 at 4:23:40 PM EDT 
To: 'Richard Kahn'

Hi Rich 

Take a look. 

I did the following: 

12 days (18th-30th Sept) @ an annual rate of $500K and then one quarter at $62.5 ($250/4). As Nicole only starts on Oct 
1st, the calculation I did was 12/365 *500K. 

Let me know if you agree. 

Paul 
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Paul Barrett 
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