
From: Ivjet( 

To: "Je vacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: N423TT 

Date: Thu, 02 May 2013 18:30:20 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

I'm meeting with Darryl manager at gulfstream in 10min, 
Sean Brown says gulfstream has a hold until payment is made, but if Dennis pays the 18k remaining that we 
owe, theoretically he can take his plane, 
I'm making the point that we are owed 300k from seller to cover what we committed to and partially paid 
$100k for prebuy 
$211k for apu upgrade,. 
More info shortly 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Thu, 2 May 2013 14:24:24 -0400 
To: lvjet< kt" 
Subject: Re: N423TT 

99 

On Thu, May 2, 2013 at 1:40 PM, <LVJETawrote: 
Jeffrey 
Gulfstream sent this message below, Dennis answered this email stating TRT Leasing paid Monday $217k for their 
portion of the prebuy, which leaves our outstanding balance of $18k owed to Gulfstream, I am going to meet with 
Gulfstream now and find out if Dennis pays our outstanding invoice, if Gulfstream will release the GIV to Terry Taylor,. I 
Think its to our advantage for Gulfstream maintain control of the GIV until seller responds to our email. do you agree? 
Gut tells me, seller wants his GIV returned so he can fly. 

from Gulfstream: 
All, 
From my understanding the aircraft would possibly be departing the facility today. As stated in previous emails, a pre-buy 
inspection requires full payment from both parties prior to departure. Once a wire transfer is completed, please let me 
know and I will confirm receipt with Savannah. If you have any questions please let us know. 
Thanks, 
Ray Kraber 
Senior Service Center Coordinator 
Gulfstream 

From: dennis 
To: Raymond Ivjet@iina 
CC: sean.brown© philivanzarella©  
Sent: 5/2/2013 1:3 : . . astem Daylight Time 
Subj: RE: N423TT 

Our wire for 21.74.+ was sent Monday. 

Best Regards, 
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Dennis Andersen 

Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 

THE INFORMATION TRANSMITTED (INCLUDING ATTACHMENTS) IS COVERED BY THE ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATIONS PRIVACY 
ACT, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE PERSON(S) OR ENTITY/ENTITIES TO WHICH IT IS ADDRESSED AND MAY 
CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL AND/OR PRIVILEGED MATERIAL. ANY REVIEW, RETRANSMISSION, DISSEMINATION OR OTHER USE OF, 
OR TAKING OF ANY ACTION IN RELIANCE UPON, THIS INFORMATION BY PERSONS OR ENTITIES OTHER THAN THE INTENDED 
RECIPIENT(S) IS PROHIBITED. IF YOU RECEIVED THIS IN ERROR, PLEASE CONTACT THE SENDER AND DELETE THE MATERIAL FROM 
ANY COMPUTER. 

From: Raymond.Kraber 
Sent: Thursday, May 2, 2 : 
To: Iva Dennis Andersen 
Cc: sea n.brown ; philip.panzarella 
Subject: N423TT 

All, 

From my understanding the aircraft would possibly be departing the facility today. As stated in previous emails, a pre-
buy inspection requires full payment from both parties prior to departure. Once a wire transfer is completed, please let 
me know and I will confirm receipt with Savannah. If you have any questions please let us know. 

Thanks, 

Ray Kraber 
Senior Service Center Coordinator 
Gulfstream 

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain 
Personal Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. 
Any Personal Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved 
service providers and may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions 
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apply to third parties. If you are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have either received this 
message in error or through interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message 
or its attachments is strictly prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express 
solely the sender's views and not those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation. 
If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original 
message. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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