
From: David Mitchell. 

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Sun, 05 Nov 2017 14:26:22 +0000 

> 

Will be at the office in 10 min 
Drafting a response to his email 

Basic is, 
$700,000 is all there is and have to find a way to make it work ( or not ) 

Have to close out construction and get TCO 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 

On Nov 5, 2017, at 9:09 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

been beating on steve and his crazy numbers . for an hour. 

On Sun, Nov 5, 2017 at 9:07 AM, David Mitchell wrote: 
Lawyer told my contact , that they need untangle some estate issue that he was not involved in , was to have 
gotten back to me Friday 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 

On Nov 5, 2017, at 6:32 AM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

cosbyy? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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