
From: 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 

Subject: Re: Hangar Costs 
Date: Tue, 15 May 2012 14:52:48 +0000 

Jeffrey, 
I will review and evaluate this cost for hanger,. I was only pre vied to cost of hanger door modification and cost of hanger floor 
paint, which I was directly involved in negotiating , all upgrades to bathroom and bedroom construction Brice informed me that 
he and Tom presented cost to you for approval. my quick review of this invoice indicates items and pricing out of control, which 
is most likely an on going problem with LSJ construction,. I will work this with Rich and get you answers asap,. 

I travel to Savannah, GA today and will fly the Bell 430 to the Toy store tomorrow,. very very excited! 

thank you, 
Larry 

In a message dated 5/15/2012 10:24:12 A.M. Eastern Daylight Time, jeevacation@gmail.com writes: 

How??? 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Date: May 15, 2012 10:20:22AM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacafion@gmail.com>
Subject: Hangar Costs 

Attached is summary of hangar costs totaling 145,424 

Please note that of that total 3,100 for kerri homes and 12,800 for abc concepts have not yet been paid (15,900) 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: May 15, 2012 9:56:23 AM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 
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