
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: payment 
Date: Tue, 05 Feb 2013 20:12:50 +0000 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From
Date: February 5, 2013 3:07:38 PM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc 
Subject: Re: payment 

I have no problem Explaining what I was doing at 3 AM. I made numerous attempts to file a police report all 
the phone records will show it. The night of the incident I contacted your employee Carlos and he said "we 
would handle it in the morning". I hope u do have us on camera, and if you do it will make this Situation a lot 
easier. The kelly bluebook on a 2004 Chevy suburban in mint condition is $10,800 shipping to St. Thomas US 
Virgin Islands is $1800 
That puts you at $ 12600.00 were are u coming up with 20k. If I was Willing to accept this offer you would still 
owe me to $ 10,400 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 5, 2013, at 2:23 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

i have attached the 2004 Suburban registration 
please note we do have liability insurance on the car but not property insurance 
please be aware that if this is litigated you will need to explain why no police report was filed, what you were 
doing out until 3am, etc. 
in addition the entire incident (in bar, parking lot) was recorded on camera which will help clarify any 
discrepancies of the fact pattern.. 
i made an offer of 3,000 so if that amount is unacceptable please tell me what is acceptable so we both can 
spend our time more productively 
thank you 

<Car Registration - 2004 Suburban.pdf> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA00715893



On Feb 5, 2013, at 1:45 PM, Dustin Skitka wrote: 

Richard 
You & I Both know the suburban is not worth 20k. I met with my attorney again a few minutes ago and he 
advised me of all my rights. He is ready to file suit for breach of contract & and advised me seek medical 
treatment, no latter than tomorrow. He is also curious why we have not received your vehicle insurance 
information. You also legally need to provide me with auto insurance. Do you have insurance? If not you all 
gave me keys and access to an uninsured vehicle and if that is the case LSJ is responsible for damages and 
medical injuries. My crew and I witnessed things on the island that could get people in a lot of trouble, we 
never signed confidentiality agreements. I have never been stiffed or screwed out of any money, until now. 
I would like to resolve this issue immediately.We can both sign cease & dismiss letters and put all this 
behind us. What is your reasonable offer? 

Thanks Dustin Skitka 
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