
From: Larry clIMI > 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Interior cost PBI shop 
Date: Fri, 21 Apr 2017 19:56:59 +0000 

RePLating cost. $50 - $60k ++ 

G550 interior re-Plating cost according to Mike Kelle, $50-$60k 
(they are completing Jack Nickolas's GV at this time). 

Depends if you can remove the plate panel and send for re-Plating,. If the mechanism can't be removed from the 
Face plate,., additional cost,. Since the unit has to be sent back to original manufacture for rePlating 

Cup holder is $90 ea 
Air Gasper is $125 ea 
Seat belt $125 ea 

Sent from my iPad 

On Apr 21, 2017, at 3:34 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Ask for replating 
On Fri, Apr 21, 2017 at 2:46 PM Larry Visoski wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Plane Perfect Palm Beach Interior Shop Labor Rate $75.00 per hour 
8 capt chairs in Cabin covered in Leather $80k 
2 Divans in Fabric $13,500 labor / Fabric $4000 = $17,500 each divan 
Carpet is $13,200 in labor, plus carpet cost? 
8 to 10 weeks when material is on hand. 

Palm Beach interior shop numbers: 
Cabin Captain chairs $10k each compete. 
We have eight Chairs =$80k 
90 man hours x $75 = $6750 labor for each chair. 
Leather required each seat 125 Sqft of Leather $3250 

Divan's,. 
180 man hours per Divan x $75.00 = $13,500 per divan in Labor 
24 to 28 Sq Yards of Fabric for each divan $ ?? 

BURN testing 
200 sqft of leather for Bum Cert 
7 sq Yards of Fabric for Burn Cert 
Takes 24 days to get Bum Cert from Skandia,. 

Carpet G550 
60 Sq Yards of Carpet needed 
176 man hours for Carpet install = $13,200 
Carpet cost $ ?? 

SeatBelts 
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Re web $350 per seat 

Sent from my iPad 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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