
From: "Peggy Siegal" < 
To: "Lesley Groff' leeyacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Total amount in Annette Siegal's estate 
Date: Mon, 04 Feb 2013 22:30:10 +0000 

Importance: Normal 

Where are you? Trying to reach you. Peg 

From: "Peggy Siegal" < 
Date: Mon, 4 Feb 2013 22:25:56 +0000 
To: Lesley Groff<jeevacationggmail.com>
ReplyTo:  
Subject: Fw: Total amount in Annette Siegal's estate 

Can I call you asap. Isn't this very low? 
Peggy Siegal Company 

From: 
Date: Mon. 4 Feb 2013 16:48:37 -0500 (EST) 
To: C 
Subject: Re: Total amount in Annette Siegal's estate 

Dear Peggy, 
The approximate value of all accounts, including the Martin Siegal Trust, as of February 1, 2013 is $1,450,000. This figure 
does not include the value of the jewelry, as well as adjustments for professional fees. 
As you know from your conversation with Sy Bressler at Bederson, they are working on finishing the final accounting, and 
expect to have it available shortly. 
Gary 

Gary Siegal 

www.salco.com 
www.nuvolighting.com 
www.kolourone.com 

In a message dated 2/4/2013 4:03:41 P.M. Eastern Standard Time, writes: 

Dear Gary: 
I hoped I would have received the single number that you said you would provide by Monday. 

You asked that I deal with you directly. 

You had me speak to Sy, which I did last Thursday. He promised he would get me that number by Monday. 

I have called his office and unfortunately he was only in for a short time today and I have not received the information. 

I do understand he is recovering from surgery and I am patiently waiting. 

Possibly he or you can get me the number tomorrow. 

EFTA00718500



Please advise. 
Thank you in advance. 
Peggy 

Pe Sie al Com any 

EFTA00718501


