From: "George Reenstra” <[} N
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation(gmail.com=>
Subject: RE: phone call
Date: Wed, 02 May 2012 13:51:52 +0000

On the purchase of your first new Sikorsky after all the negotiations were done in order to make the
deal work | agreed from Sikorsky to take 100k less, normally | would make between 250, 300k all
depending on the final cost of the helicopter.. This and | know you don't believe it had nothing to do
with your cost. So on your first new Sikorsky | made approx 250k, If | recall the final price you paid
was around 10.4m, | sold it for you to Randy Lermner (a s-92 client of ming) for approx 12.7m you paid
me 100k  When you bought your second 76 Sikorsky again paid me a commission approx 250k and |
think you paid in the low 11.3m range. | then sold it for you for 11.9m and we took the ship 472 in
trade. At 1.5m You paid me 100k for selling 750. We then agree to split the sale profits of 472 (
after expenses ) the trade value was 1.5m and | sold it for 2.2m for you. As of now | have been paid
100k only.

When | sold a helicopter for you | was paid a commission, typically 100k. On 472 we agreed to the
split of profit. As of now | have only been paid 100k. The buyer held back 250k for issues, | pulled
every favor | had to make those issues go away and they did it ended up costing only 15k You got the
235k back

| am an agent for Sikorsky and certainly Darren and Larry knew | acted as an agent for them. If that
weren't the case and since you never paid me a fee for the purchase of the 2 new 76's why would |
have been involved. Every deal | did for you | got you a great purchase or sale price, | never asked for
more than was agreed.

472 was sold to Greenwich Aero Leasing , their operating arm is Summit Aviation. They are changing
it to offshore and will operate it in Brazil in support of a contract they have there.

Guardian Jet represented Aetna in the purchase of 750 from you, any fee they got was from Aetna .
Guardian also sold a used 76 ( from Merck) to Greenwich Aero Leasing...... there were NO monies
exchanged or paid to or from them from us. Their deal with Aetna is unknown to me.

In the end you hold all the cards, | have always made you money, | thought we had a deal. | have
never cheated you. As Darren knows | have health issues and this stress is not something | need in
my life just tell me your decision.

George Reenstra
Mobile:
Email:

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2012 9:20 AM

To: George Reenstra

Cc: Ivjet; Richard Kahn; Darren Indyke

Subject: Re: phone call

what i have taken away from todays call, and please correct me if 1 misunderstood, was that in fact you had

gotten 100k less than you would ordinarly get in the purchase of my helizs to make the deals work . you said that
you weren't working for free , and therefore felt no need to disclose the fact that in addtion to the commsion on
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selling my helis you had received approx 500k . from the purchases. and that guardain a new name | also
received commisions, ( not related to you ) and that summit now owns it and is leasing it to a brazilian operation

On Wed, May 2. 2012 at 8:46 AM, George Reenstra <[ - ' 1otc:

Itis 845 | am available whenever you wish to talk.

George Reenstra
Mobile:
Email:
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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