From: brice gordon _}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: VI Gunite
Date: Mon, 07 Nov 2011 14:54:45 +0000

do vou wish to proceed placing tile order for 1 x1 tile

On Sun, Nov 6, 2011 at 8:57 AM, — *i_* wrote:

Thank you
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 6, 2011, at 7:58 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(a gmail com™> wrote:

ok , so lets delay it until sometime in january or feb.. no urgency, if we can't be sure.,

On Sun, Nov 6, 2011 at 11:43 AM, brice gordon ﬂ_’ wrote:

Jeffrey

to have the pools ready by the Mid December, all material will need to be on LSJ by Thanks Giving, to do
s0 would require us to order tile Monday 7th.

Tile has already been sourced in California, the rest of the material will come from Florida

Preparation of pools would need to start before Thanks Giving so tile and plaster work could begin 1st
week of December, this would mean that the pools would need to be drained at the end of this week at the
latest.

This schedule doesn't allow for any screw ups shipping, ete, | have concerns that deadline will not be
meet,

Please note waterline tile still needs to be selected.

On Wed, Nov 2, 2011 at 3:50 PM, Gary Kemney {_'-'-* wrote:

If you go forward we should execute our contract and attach the proposal to it.
Brice . | would review with bart on the exact specifications of the materials and sources and timing for
delivery and installation

Sent from my 1Phone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Wendy Lockman <] | | RN

Date: November 2, 2011 2:03:26 PM EDT

Subject: LSJ

Reply-To: Wendy Lockman <

Gary,
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Attached you will find the material list and change order number 11. We have a balance on the flag
pool of $34.742.19. Hard cost for us to replaster the pool is approximately $14,000.00 - $15,000.00.
All the labor to redo the plaster 1s given. All of the guys were paid their daily wage so they will re-
trowel for nothing. We have to pay for the new Diamond Brite only. We will also have to chip out the
existing Diamond Brite. There 1s no profit or overhead with this cost as 1t 1s a hard cost. This 1s what 1t
will cost me to come in and replaster the pool. [ would like to see at least $ 20,000.00 of my balance

wired over to me please. Let me know if you have any further questions.

Thank you,

Bart Wolterman

Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
LISV
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The information contained 1n this communication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to _'._ and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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Little Saint James
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