
From: Richard Kahn isislailasiii@goiSds 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Promissory Note 

Date: Thu, 15 Sep 2011 23:09:23 +0000 
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From: Barry Josephson <rs -fly '—
Date: Thu, 15 Sep 2011 15:14:27 -0700 
To: Richard Kahn aiabar.dkaluJagliwoaiLraco>
Subject: Re: Promissory Note 

Richard, 

You are correct, and I greatly appreciate the extension. Thanks for the kind words regarding trust from Jeffery, I wont let him 
down. 

Best, 
Barry J 

Barry Josephson 
Josephson Entertainment 
501 Santa Monica Blvd. 
Suite 700 
Santa Monica. CA 90401 
(atteteir 906•2901— 
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From: Richard Kahn <rifikamikagehlaeasaiaii.srasia>
Date: Thu, 15 Sep 2011 11:57:23 -0700 
To: Barry Josephson < I \ 
Subject: Re: Promissory Note 

I understand that money was to be repaid by end of September but another 2 weeks is ok as Jeffrey trusts you 100% 
Please call me with any questions 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 

EFTA00720240



New York, NY 10065 
tel ettelettleell 
fax 640-350-0954
cell 917 111 7504 

On Sep 14, 2011, at 4:42 PM, Barry Josephson wrote: 

Understood. I'm doing my best to accrue enough from my income to quickly pay the balance plus the interest. I will make a 
payment in October. 

Barry Josephson 
Josephson Entertainment 
501 Santa Monica Blvd. 
Suite 700 
Santa Monica. CA 90401 
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From: Richard Kahn <r
Date: Wed, 14 Sep 2011 10:38:40 -0700 
To: Barry Josephson impulfle 
Subject: Promissory Note 

I have attached a schedule of payments and balance outstanding with interest as of 9/15/2011 
Please advise on final payments.. 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-481 I
fax 0413-3 U-UUOLI 
cell 91,001SP984 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: kosbielmobeibitheeeemeteast 
Date: September 14, 2011 1:47:43 PM EDT 
To: reslaeraelas-la@gaRe+keem 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Reply-To:  
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