From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Larry Delson
Date: Thu, 14 Aug 2014 17:15:33 +0000

May - billed FT Real Estate 25,000
June - billed HBREK 25,000

Please advise who he shall bill for July?

Thank vou

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: lawrence delson <
Date: August 14, 2014 at 9:41:41 AM EDT
To: " "<

Reply-To: lawrence delson

Hi Rich

Although I am in China for a couple of more days, I was wondering if you had any word on who 1 should
bill for July.

Best
Larry Delson

Delson International, Inc.
P.O. BOX 3776
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