
KREt 'SLIER-WALSH, 

COM PIANI & VARGAS, M. 

SUITE 503. FLAGLER CENTER 

SOP SOUTH FLAGLER DRIVE 

WEST PALM BEACH, FLORIDA 33401-13913 

JANE RREUSLER-WALSH 

BARBARA J. COMPIANI 

REBECCA MERCIER VARGAS 

BOARD CERTIFIED APPELLATE LAWYERS 

July 2, 2009 

Robert Critton 
Burman Critton Luttier & Coleman 
515 N. Flagler Drive, Suite 400 
West Palm Beach, FL 33401 

Re: State of Florida v. Epstein 
15th Circuit Court Case No. 2008CF009381A 
4DCA Case No. 4D09-2554 

Dear Mr. Critton: 

TE,LPMONE (561) 659-5455 

ricsainz (561) 620-6762 

Attached is our statement for services rendered through the filing of the 
emergency petition for certiorari. Please advise if there are different billing 
instructions for this case. Otherwise, I will send this on to you each month to be 
forwarded to the client for payment. Thank you. 

Sincerely, 

kw_ 
Barbra A. Lee, Administrator 
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Kreusler-Walsh, Compiani & Vargas, P.A. 
Suite 503 - Flagler Center 
501 South Flagler Drive 

West Palm Beach, FL 33401 
(561) 659-5455 

July I, 2009 
Reference No. 1735 

Jeffrey Epstein 
do Robert Critton 
Burman Critton Luttier 
& Coleman 
515 N. Flagkr Drive, #400, West Palm Beach, FL 33401 

For Professional Services Rendered Through: 07/01/09 
Matter Number: 2691.O-269IA Title: State of Florida v. JEFFREY EPSTEIN 

Att'y Rate Hours Fees 

06/25/09 BJC Prepare for and attend hearing re: motion for stay 400.00 2.00 $800.00 

06/25/09 JKW Telephone conference with Bob Critton, review 
motion for stay and attachments, conference with 
BJC, revise motion for stay memo, draft e-mail 
to Connie 450.00 1.20 $540.00 

06/26/09 JKW Review pleadings, research 450.00 5.30 52,385.00 

06/26/09 RMV Conference with JKW and review prior research 
and form files re: certiorari from order lifting 
confidentiality 375.00 0.30 S112.50 

06/28/09 JKW Review cases, preparation for petition 450.00 3.20 S1,440.00 

06/29/09 JKW Continue preparation, draft motion to review 
denial of stay and petition for certiorari, multiple 
revisions 450.00 8.40 53,780.00 

06/29/09 RMV Research (administrative order in effect when 
records sealed) 375.00 0.10 $37.50 

06/29/09 BJC Telephone conferences with court reporter re: 
expediting transcript (.3); review draft of motion 
for stay (.5) 400.00 0.80 5320.00 

06/30/09 RMV Conference with JKW and research method of 
appellate review; rule governing unsealing 
records in criminal cases; multiple revisions to 
petition for certiorari and emergency motion to 
stay; draft motion to rely on one appendix (2.7); 
proof for filing emergency motion for stay, 
petition, motion to seal, motion to file one 
appendix (1.6) 375.00 4.30 SI ,612.50 
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06/30/09 .1KW Assemble appendix, fill in appendix references, 
revise certiorari petition, and motion to review 
multiple times, draft e-mail to Bob Critton and 
Jack Goldberger, review Bob Critton and Jack 
Goldberger's revisions and revise petition and 
motion, review Martin Weinberg's e-mails, revise 
petition and motion, revise motion to seal and 
motion to file one appendix, draft 
correspondence to court 

06/30/09 BJC Draft motion to file under seal (.8); proof and 
revise motion to file under seal (.2); proof 
appendix (.3); proof certiorari petition and 
motion to review (.6) 

Total Hours and Fees: 

Costs Advanced 

06/29/09 

06/30/09 

Disbursement to: State of Florida: 

Disbursement to: State of Florida: 

Amount 
5441.00 

$225.00 

06/30/09 Disbursement to: Fourth District Ct. of Appeal: Filing Fee 5300.00 
Photocopy charges through: 07/01/09 S539.25 

Current Fees: $16,027.50 
Current Cost: $1,505.25 

Amount Due: $17,532.75 

Less Retainer Applied: -S10.000.00 

Timekeeper Summary 
Balance Due: 57,532.75 

Tkpr Name Of Timekeeper Hours Fee Amount 
1KW Jane Kreusler-Walsh 27.70 512,465.00 
BJC Barbara J. Compiani 4.50 51,800.00 
RMV Rebecca Mercier Vargas 4.70 SI,762.50 

36.90 $16,027.50 

450.00 9.60 

400.00 1.70 

36.90 

$4,320.00 

$680.00 

S16,027.50 
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OFFICIAL COURT REPORTERS 
Palm Beach County Courthouse 

205 North Dixie Highway 
Room 5.1400 

West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 

DATE: June 30, 2009 

TO: 

RE: 

INVOICE 

Barbara Compiana, P.A. 
501 S. Nagler Dr. suite 503 
West Palm Beach, FL 33401 
561-659-5455. 

State of Florida versus Jeffrey 
Case No(s): 2008CF009381AXX 
Date: 6/26/09 - DAILY 

25 PAGES @ $9.00 page 

BALANCE DUE 

SE.CEN 

SO 34 '151
A
DMINGIter 

c(4.FIF1)estliti,,x0Aor 

Epstein 

$225.00 

$225.00 

TRANSCRIPT IS READY TO BE PICKED UP WHEN PAYMENT IS 
RECEIVED. THANK YOU. 

MAKE CHECK PAYABLE TO: 
***STATE OF FLORIDA*** 
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OFFICIAL COURT REPORTERS 
Palm Beach County Courthouse 

205 North Dixie Highway 
Room 5.1400 

West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 

INVOICE 

June 29, 2009 

Barbara Compiana, P.A. 
501 S. Flagler Drive, Suite 503 
West Palm Beach, FL 33401 

RE: State of Florida v. Jeffrey Epstein 
Case No(s): 08-9381CF AXX 
Date(s): 6/25/09 

RECEIVED 
jui4 Z009

COURT 
ADMINISTRATION 

F1FT EENTul 
ZIRCAIIT 

49 pages at $9.00 per page [Original] $441.00 

PLEASE MAKE CHECK PAYABLE TO: 
STATE OF FLORIDA 
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Fourth District Court of Appeal 
1525 Palm Beach Lakes Blvd. 

West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 
(561)-242-2000 

ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF NEW CASE 

DATE: July 1, 2009 

STYLE: JEFFREY EPSTEIN v. STATE OF FLORIDA 

4DCA#: 4D09-2554 

The Fourth District Court of Appeal has received the Petition reflecting 
a filing date of W1/09 

The county of origin is Palm Beach. 

The lower tribunal case number provided is 20098CF009381 A 

The filing fee is Paid In Full - S300. 

Case Type: Certiorari Criminal 

The Fourth District Court of Appeal's case number must be utilized on all pleadings and correspondence 
filed in this cause. Moreover, ALL PLEADINGS SIGNED BY AN ATTORNEY MUST INCLUDE THE 
ATTORNEY'S FLORIDA BAR NUMBER. 

Please review and comply with any handouts enclosed with this acknowledgment. 

RECEIPT 

JEFFREY EPSTEIN v. STATE OF FLORIDA 

4DCA#: 4DO9-2554 

Receipt # R2009-1015476 

Method of Payment: CK 

Filing Fee: $300.00 

Total: $300.00 

Check # 25986 PAYER: Jane ICreusler-Walsh 

Scanned and mailed to titkinber5, Cri.thm, Gott/buyer 

r I REIT[f 
JUL 0 2 2009 

By 

-1 

EFTA00721982


