KREUSLER-WALSH,
CompPiant & VARGAS, -.

SUITE 803, FLAGLER CENTER
501 SOUTH FLAGLER DRIVE
WEST PALM BEACH, FLORIDA 33401-5913

SJANE EREUSLER-WALSM
BARBARA J COMPLAMNI
REBECCA MERCIER VARGAS
BOARD CERTIFIED APPELLATE LAWYERS

July 24, 2009
Via e-mail

Robert Critton

Burman Critton Luttier & Coleman
515 N. Flagler Drive, Suite 400
West Palm Beach, FL 33401

Re: State of Florida v. Epstein

1 5th Circuit Court Case No. 2008CF009381 A

4DCA Case No. 4D09-2554

Dear Mr. Critton:

TELEPHONE (BB1) 659-54685
FACSIMILE (581} B20-8762

Attached is our statement for services rendered through the filing of the
reply to their responses in the emergency petition for certiorari. We still have
attorneys’ fees responses to draft and file. Please forward the statement to the
client for payment. Do not hesitate to contact our office if you have any questions.

Thank you.

Sincerely,

Enclosure

EFTA00721986



Kreusler-Walsh, Compiani & Vargas, P.A.

Suite 503 - Flagler Center
501 South Flagler Drive
West Palm Beach, FL 33401

Jeffrey Epstein

/o Robert Critton

Burman Critton Luttier

& Coleman

515 N. Flagler Drive, #400, West Palm Beach, FL 33401

July 24, 2009

Reference No. 1739

For Professional Services Rendered Through: 07/24/09

Matter Number: 2691-0-2691A Title: State of Florida v. JEFFREY EPSTEIN
Aty Rate Hours

07/01/09 JKW Telephone conference with Bill Berger 450.00 020
07/06/09 GC  Draft petitioner's docketing statement 85.00 2.20
07/06/09 RMYV Revise docketing statement 375.00 0.30
07/07/09 JEW Review Bill Berger e-mails re: 6/12 transeript,

telephone conferences with Bob Critton, review

6/12 transcript, draft e-mail to Bill Berger 450.00 1.40
07/13/09 RMV Conference with JKW re: remedies if respondent,

Post, included confidential material in appendix

to response 375.00 0.20

07/13/09 JKW Review pleadings and transcript in Post's
appendix, review Post response, draft e-mail to
Jack Goldberger and Bob Critton, review EW.
response and transcript 450.00

07/13/09 GC  Pull, print and tab cases for Palm Beach Post's
response o emergency petition for writ of

certiorari 85.00
07/14/09 MV  Pull and tab cases to response of BB 85.00
07/14/09 JKW Review BB response, outline all 3 responses,

draft and review e-mail's 1o and from team,

research, preparation for reply, conference with

RMY, review e-mail from Post attorney, draft

response; draft motion to file one reply 450.00

07/14/09 RMYV Review responses to petition for certiorari filed
by the Post, E'W. and B.B. (1.1); revise twice
motion to file one reply (.5); rescarch reply 1o
argumenis re: secrecy of grand jury proceedings
and conferences with JKW re: strategy for replies

1.40

220

1.00

4.30

Fees

$90.00

$187.00

$112.50

$630.00

$75.00

$£630.00

$187.00

$85.00

$1,935.00
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(2.9) 375.00 4.50 $1,687.50

07/15/09 JEKW Continue research, telephone conferences with
Bob Critton, preparation for reply, begin drafting
reply, review pleadings, e-mailed by Jessica,
conference with RMV 450.00 7.80 $3,510.00

07/15/09 RMV Research (confidentiality of Federal Grand Jury
proceedings; applicability of public records
exemptions for grand jury proceedings or
prosecuting investigation), draft and revise reply
to writ of certiorari on these issues, conference
with JKW 375.00 6.40 $2,400.00

07/16/09 JKW Draft reply (2.7); revise reply (1.2); review
multiple e-mails from Jessica and draft replies,
telephone conference with Jack Goldberger,

0717109 JKW Revise reply multiple times; review 7/11/08
transcript 450,00 5.30 $2,385.00

07/17/0% RMV Review draft reply and revise, draft revisions re:
Grand Jury secrecy and distinguishing

defendant's cases on this issue 375.00 2.40 $900.00
07/18/09 RMYV Revise reply, check citations and quotations to

legal authorities, key cite cases 375.00 2.90 $1,087.50
07/18/09 JEW Revise reply 450,00 0.80 $360.00
07/20/09 JEW Review RMV's revisions and questions, revise

reply, draft e-mail to team with attached response 450.00 1.20 $540.00
07/21/09 JKW Check appendix and responses references and

quotes; drafl e-mail to Jack Goldberger, Bob

Critton and Martin Weinberg, review responses

from Jack Goldberger and Bob Critton, review

Martin Weinberg e-mail with revisions, draft

e-mail to Martin Weinberg, revise reply 450,00 2.30 $1,035.00

07/22/09 JKW Review Martin Weinberg e-mail with additional
revisions, continue revising reply, review Bob
Critton e-mail, revise again, draft e-mail to team
(1.7), review Martin Weinberg additional
revisions and e-mail, revise reply, review Martin
Weinberg e-mail re: Post motion for fees and
draft response (.6) 450.00 230 $1,035.00

07/23/09 RMYV Review and revise reply to emergency petition
for certiorari, conference with JKW re: suggested

revisions, proofread reply for filing 375.00 0.80 $300.00
07/23/09 JKW Proof reply and appendix for filing 450.00 0.60 $270.00
Total Hours and Fees: 55.70 $21,781.50
Costs Advanced
Amount
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07/16/09 Disbursement to: American Express: Federal Express Petition for Cert $129.23

Postage charges through: 07/24/09 $20.83

Photocopy charges through: 07/24/09 $128.00

Previous Balance: $£17,532.75

Payment Received On Account: {$10,000.00)

Current Fees: $£21,781.50

Current Cost: $278.06

Amount Due; $29,592.31

Timekeeper Summary
_Tkpr  Name Of Timekeeper Hours  Fee Amount

JKW  Jane Kreusler-Walsh 3280  $14,760.00
MV Marian L. Vlastos 1.00 $85.00
GC Marilyn Combs 4.40 £374.00
RMV  Rebecca Mercier Vargas 17.50 $6,562.50

5570  $21,781.50
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