
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Cecile de Jongh 
Subject: Re: ASU - Origins Meeting and Passionate Minds Meeting 

Date: Fri, 24 Sep 2010 15:00:08 +0000 

nathan needs no reimbursment 

On Fri, Sep 24, 2010 at 10:24 AM, Cecile de Jongh > wrote: 
Jeffrey, 

Unfortunately, in August, I had already agreed with Lawrence to pay for 
business class tickets (attendees only - not spouses). Most of the attendees 
have already purchased their tickets. Jeanne and I went over the IRS 
guidelines, such that it is, for private foundations. None of these people are 
affiliated with the foundation (i.e. staff, directors etc...) which might make 
it easier to support the reimbursement of business class tickets. We are in the 
process of adopting a travel policy for grantees. I made it clear to Lawrence 
that the foundation will not pay for any extras at the hotel such as spa 
treatments, scuba diving and the like. 

For the Passionate Minds meeting in January, Al and I discussed paying for two 
coach tickets since he said that he explained to you that those attendees would 
not come without their spouses or s.o.'s. If they want to upgrade they can do 
that on their own. Nathan is flying in on his own plane so I am not sure how we 
address reimbursement for him but Jeanne and I will review and incorporate 
thatin the travel policy. 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be 
privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution 

or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and 
delete all copies. 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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