
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: George Reenstra
Subject: Re: 750 

Date: Thu, 06 May 2010 15:26:17 +0000 

ok 

On Wed, May 5, 2010 at 7:19 PM, George Reenstra < > wrote: 

I would like to advertise 750 in the media ( controller print and online ) this is my expense. Need you to confirm you 
must net 12.3m My comm. is above that for the first 100k, if anther broker is involved you will be advised just like when 
we thought Mike Jones was involved before. Would advertise as make offer but with the understanding that 12.6m is 
the price then if we must go down we can. Please advise we have deadline for print 

Darren, do you have all you need from Sikorsky on the D, we need to get that done in the very near term. If not please 
advise 

I know we owe you prices for offshore, they are in process. 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 

300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 

Mahwah, NJ 07430 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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