
From: "Rich Kahn"

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: "Emad Hanna"

Subject: FW: Claim # 523990 L.S.J, LLC & Jeffrey Epstein 

Date: Fri, 19 Nov 2010 21:32:23 +0000 

Attachments: Debris_Payment_523990.doc 

Attached is resolution for the LSJ insurance claim 

We will be receiving an additional 42,460 for the debris cleanup 

Total insurance proceeds collected from claim total 157,826 (42,460 + 115,366) 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

From: Johnson, Wardell [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, November 19, 2010 4:25 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Flaherty, Patrick 
Subject: RE: Claim # 523990 L.S.J, LLC & Jeffrey Epstein 

Mr. Kahn, 

We will be processing this additional payment for the debris removal as agreed. The total additional payment is $42,460, 
per the attached letter. 

Please let me know if there are any questions. 

Thanks. 

EFTA00734983



Wardell Johnson 

General Adjuster 

Private Client Group 

Chartis 

701 Brickell Avenue, Suite 2300 

Miami, FL 33131 

EFTA00734984


