From: Jeffrey Epstein %_':f
To: Emad Hanna a_
Ce: Gary Kemey <N
Subject: Re: LS] Master Suite Project
Date: Thu, 05 Aug 2010 00:50:31 +0000

approved

On Wed, Aug 4, 2010 at 3:06 PM, Emad Hanna &_ wrote:

Jeffrey,

Attached 15 a payment request submitted by Gary for § 36,650 for purchasing Marble for the Master Suite
Bath.

The project line item is $ 90,000 and this is the 13" expenditure in this category and we need your approval to
proceed since its higher than Gary’s approval rate.

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HBRK Associates

PO Box 488

New York, NY 18158

Ph

Fax [
|
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to h: and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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