
From: Jeffrey Epstein  

To: Rich Kahn 

Subject: Fwd: 

Date: Sat, 07 Aug 2010 17:43:43 +0000 

caclulate jessica feees„„„„jack„ rich can confirm that even jay discounted his bills by 15% because of teh 
horrenous results. 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jack Goldberger  
Date: Sat, Aug 7, 2010 at 9:07 AM 
Subject: RE: 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 

just starting to look at Critton bills. The hourly rate is out of line given the volume of work. $500 is upward side of reasonable 
for partner if smaller amount of work, but given amount of work that should be discounted 20-25%% based on custom and 
practice. The hourly for associates is way high. Jessica bothers me to no end. Billing her at $125. How much is her gross 
billing. Our deal and I cut this deal with him is that we would pay her salary, because he was complaining about not having 
enough support, not he would make money off of her. Believe her salary was between 60-70k What is the difference 
between that and what he billed for her time? continuing to review 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailbo:l 
Sent: Fri 8/6/2010 2:45 PM 
To: Jack Goldberger 
Subject: 

critten total fees 3.1 million , fax research , and photcpoy 100k. other third parties 200k, 
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