
From: Jeffrey Epstein cti 
To: Rich Kahn  

Subject: Re: FW: Epstein 
Date: Thu, 12 Aug 2010 17:05:10 +0000 

jack should be out of it 

On Thu, Aug 12, 2010 at 12:58 PM, Rich Kahn
Not sure what your thoughts are on Jack's office paying bills going 
forward 
Please advise on how much to send as they are asking for 159.08 

 Original Message-----
From: Sherry Mahoney [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, August 12, 2010 12:51 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jack Goldberger 
Subject: Epstein 

Hi Rich, 

I need money in the expense account. I received the $2000.00 the other 
day, but I need an additional $159.08 to cover the Wackenhut bill. 
Plus, if you want me to pay any other bills in the future, I will need 
money for that. Please let me know. 

Sherry 
Assistant to Jack Goldberger 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to  and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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EFTA00737844


