
From: 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: invoice 

Date: Thu, 22 Jul 2010 22:49:36 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice_7.22.10.doc 

22, 2010, at 2:51 PM, Serafin Caamano wrote: 

Please find attached our invoice for the professional services rendered at Little Saint James on 6.30.10 & 
7.1.10. 

Please contact me with any questions. 

Thank you. 

Serafin Caamano, jr. 
Budd Woodwork Inc. 
54 Franklin Street 
Brooklyn, New York 11222 

Office: 
Fax: 
Mobile: 

From: Serafin Caamano [mailto 
Sent: Tuesday, July 20, 2010 2:04 PM 
To: 
Subject: follow up 

Please let us know if there is any feedback for either of the projects that Mr. Epstein was interested in doing. 

Thank you. 

EFTA00738659



Serafin Caamano, jr. 
Budd Woodwork Inc. 
54 Franklin Street 
Brooklyn, New York 11222 

Office: 
Fax: 
Mobile: 

From:I Dnailto: 
Sent: on ay, July 12, 2010 5:48 PM 
To: Serafin Caamano 
Subject: Re: Library LS.1 

Hi Serafin, 

That would be great. Can we say we'll meet at 2.30 pm at 71st street? 

Regards, 

On Jul 12, 2010, at 4:34 PM, Serafin Caamano wrote: 

I can bring the panels into the city tomorrow, I could be there around 11 am or after. 

Other images: 

Images 1784 & 1789 are European Oak as installed at 778 Park, a Ferguson & Shamamian project. 

Image 0305 is development mock up for the same project. (a bit darker) 

Image 1589 is a mockup for our current project. 

Image 0291 is a panel from the Neue Gallerie, 1048 Fifth Ave. 

EFTA00738660



Serafin Caamano, jr. 
Budd Woodwork Inc. 
54 Franklin Street 
Brooklyn, New York 11222 

Office: 
Fax: 
Mobile: 

From: [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, July 12, 2010 3:55 PM 
To: Serafin Caamano 
Subject: Re: Library LS.1 

Hi Serafin, 

Will you be in the city at all today or tomorrow in the day.. wondering if there is a way to see these panels in 
person before I leave for the Island tomorrow evening. 

Also, do you have any other type of european oak panel finishes that you can send via email for us to see. 

Thanks, 
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