
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To:' 

Subject: Re: Fw: 
Date: Wed, 02 Sep 2009 16:19:30 +0000 

email story and or ■ , you can get invoices from 

On Wed, Sep 2, 2009 at 12:17 PM, < > wrote: 
Ok, I can't do anything re the electricity without talking to her. 
She left no instructions or building contacts and nobody here or in the office knows what she did 

Sent via BlacicBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Wed, 2 Sep 2009 12:12:57 -0400 

To: n 
Subject: Re: Fw: 
she twelve hours ahead 

On Wed, Sep 2, 2009 at 12:09 PM, N E M wrote: 

I have been trying to reach. all day but no luck... 

  Forwarded Messa e 
From: Rich Kahn 
To: 
Cc: 
Sent: Wednesday, September 2, 2009 8:52:20 AM 
Subject: RE: 

n turned I just spoke witI and she told me that she  off all utilities (cable, intemet and electricity) from her name 
as of 6/30/09. S fete sai at was handling the future payments. Bella and I have not seen any bills or paid 
anything in the last two months. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

EFTA00739243



*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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