From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com>
To: Harry Beller | A
Subject: Fwd:
Date: Wed, 23 Sep 2009 17:23:43 +0000

—————————— Forwarded message --———-—--

From: Alan Dershowitz b
Date: Wed, Sep 23, 2009 at 1:23 PM

Subject: Re:

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail. com™

Happy to provide them. Can he resend his email of last Dec.

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Date: Wed, 23 Sep 2009 12:47:45 -0400

To: Alan M. Dershowitz< ||

Subject:

alan,, harry has reviewed to numbers you and i can speak , you can talk to him, what he needs to complete 1s
back up for 178,000 dollars invoice from 1 07, he requested it in his email to you of last dec.. details of out of
town hours. all bills submitted since dec of 08, he only has your april communication saying there were 23

hours since dec 08

EE R S et s S S A e L s T

The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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The information contained n this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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