
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: funding of your personal account 
Date: Wed, 30 Sep 2009 20:56:23 +0000 

yes 

On Wed, Sep 30, 2009 at 4:15 PM, Rich Kahn > wrote: 

I have attached spending from the last time we funded which was September 15th. Do I have your approval to 
fund 1,000,000 from FTC JP Morgan? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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