From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com>
To: Harry Beller <
Subject: Re: FW:
Date: Thu, 01 Oct 2009 20:12:05 +0000

you tell me my numbers are incorrect , please tell me how they are incorrect.  as in my last email you have not
provided the back up to even claim the hours you have invocied

On Thu, Oct 1, 2009 at 4:08 PM, Harry Beller <] - ' otc:

--—--Original Message-----

From: Alan Dershowitz [mailm:_]
Sent: Thursday, October 01, 2009 4:08 PM

To: Harry Beller

Subject: Re:

Please explain how your calculations,including the guarantee, show I've
been"overpaid". Even if your numbers were correct, which they are not, |
am still owed well over $100,000, as [ will show Jeff. I know you think
that the guarantee 1s not binding unless 1t 1s "in writing" but that

really 1s not your call.

------ Original Message------

From: Harry Beller

To: Dershowitz Alan Dershowitz

Subject:

Sent; Oct 1, 2009 3:58 PM

Alan

Total amount paid was 3,935,613.40. This includes 600,462 that you paid
to your brother and others.

The total hours that you billed (without the backup that has been
requested on numerous occasions but as of today still has not been
received) was 2,607.25.

December 2006 details and the details of out of town hours have never
been received though [ had asked for it on numerous occasions. To date
the only backup that I have received for millions of dollars in payments
was 3 photocopied pages with no legible explanation. | have requested in
December 08 documentation to support the transfer of 178,000 that was
paid but never invoiced.

This is my tally of your non documented billings through December of
2008. You have sent a note in April that said that 26,450 was owed as of
April of 09 for work done in 09. Mr. Epstein tells me you have
additional hours after that., but I have never received an invoice or

bill.

I've tried the calculations numerous ways and you have been overpaid.

Thanks

Harry

EFTA00740185



-----Original Message-----

From: Alan Dershowitz [mailto: | | G |
Sent: Thursday, October 01, 2009 2:41 PM

To: Harry Beller

Subject:

Please send me your numbers in preparation for my call with
jeffrey.please include total fee paid to me, which you said was 30k plus
more than my figure. Also total hours you say [ billed(which you said
was 60+ less than my figure. I told jeffrey the difference between our
figures was "relatively small". You apparantly said the opposite. Let's
see the precise numbers so jeffrey can decide . Thanks

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

S St R e e R L
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If yvou have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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