
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: FW: Education Fee's 
Date: Mon, 05 Oct 2009 19:36:43 +0000 

both 

On Mon, Oct 5, 2009 at 3:28 PM, Rich Kahn 

Is your response Yes to pay bill or Yes to company wide change in policy? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

to 

> wrote: 

From: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Monday, October 05, 2009 2:52 PM 
To: Rich Kahn; Darren Indyke 
Subject: FW: Education Fee's 

FYI 

Rich can please process payment for Education Fee's for Luca, I would like to speak to Carlos directly next week. 

Any questions or concerns please contact me. 

Brice 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacationtegmail.com 
Sent: Monday, October 05, 2009 12:41 PM 
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To: Brice Gordon 
Subject: Re: Education Fee's 

Yes 

On Mon, Oct 5, 2009 at 2:26 PM, Brice Gordon < 

To JEE 

As requested 

wrote: 

I spoke with Cecile in regard to Education Fee's for Luca, Carlos's Son. Her recommendation," to be fair" is to pay this year, but at 
the same time forward a letter saying this would be the last time this would occur. 

Is this a company wide policy change? 

Please advise 

Brice 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jea@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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