
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Martin Weinberg

Subject: Re: Fw: CONFIDENTIAL - 

Date: Mon, 19 Oct 2009 23:31:45 +0000 

i'll follow up 

On Mon, Oct 19, 2009 at 7:21 PM, Martin Weinberg < 
Jeffrey 
As emailed to Rich Kahn today 

— Original Message --
From: Martin Weinberg 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: 
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2009 7:20 PM 
Subject: CONFIDENTIAL -

> wrote: 

Rich 
Attached is a revised invoice for both August and September legal charges. The bank confirmed 
that there was no monthly wire for the past invoice. I have issued a revised invoice to substitute for 
the earlier Oct invoice and to include the prior unpaid invoice that was e-mailed to you on or shortly 
after 9-1-09. 
The revised invoice covering the two month period is attached 
Please confirm its receipt 
Marty 
Martin G. Weinberg 
MARTIN G. WEINBERG, PC 
20 Park Plaza, Suite 1000 
Boston. MA 02116 

**************************************************************************** 

This Electronic Message contains information from the Law Office of Martin G. Weinberg, P.C., 
and may be privileged. The information is intended for the use of the addressee only. If you are 
not the addressee, please note that any disclosure, copying, distribution, or use of the contents 
of this message is prohibited. 
**************************************** ******** ******* ******** ******* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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