From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationfwgmail.com=
To: Emad Hanna {_='
Subject: Re: Mechanical Building
Date: Wed, 25 Nov 2009 19:02:12 +0000

how 1s that possible,, 1s it all up and running/>

On Tue, Nov 24, 2009 at 11:03 AM, Emad Hanna f_‘»* wrote:

Jeffrey,

I received an approval from Gary to pay 5 200,123.20 to Michael Glidden for work completed.

Of the original budget of § 724,307 20 we have paid $ 524,184 and this payment represents the balance due.

Please provide vour approval to process this payment if you're ok with this.

Thank you

Emad Hanna
Project Controller
HBRK Associates
PO Box 400

New York, NY 10150

EFTAO00742451



EE R S S L A s s A s R A L e st
The information contained n this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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