
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Gary Kemey 

Subject: Re: Mechanical Building 

Date: Wed, 25 Nov 2009 23:01:12 +0000 

it says to complete contract„ is there another contract for phase 2 

On Wed, Nov 25, 2009 at 5:36 PM, Gary Kerney > wrote: 
This completes phase one that transfered the island onto the wapa power in anticipation of the future generator 
installation in the mech 
Building as well as the distribution conduit and all the switch gear. The phase is complete per the contract. The 
final phase in the approved budget will include the transfer switch to connect the generators as back up to 
wappa. Gary. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 25, 2009, at 4:21 PM, "Emad Hanna" < > wrote: 

Gary, 

I sent JE an approval request to pay Glidden and he wrote me the below response 

How do you want me to respond to this or are you going to contact him and let him know. 

Thanks 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Ph 

Fax 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacationegmall.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2009 2:02 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: Mechanical Building 
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how is that possible„ is it all up and running/> 

On Tue, Nov 24, 2009 at 11:03 AM, Emad Hanna 

Jeffrey, 

> wrote: 

I received an approval from Gary to pay $ 200,123.20 to Michael Glidden for work completed. 

Of the original budget of $ 724,307.20 we have paid $ 524,184 and this payment represents the balance due. 

Please provide your approval to process this payment if you're ok with this. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Ph 

Fax 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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