
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: "IMI " 
Subject: Re: Fw: News 

Date: Thu, 10 Dec 2009 15:23:39 +0000 

larry you said george was going to send me something „ inever got it.. i want a completed price and delivery 
time if i am to do this deal 

On Thu, Dec 10, 2009 at 10:09 AM, ..a> wrote: 
From Reenstra: 
I told him we need firm price of c++ before making a decision on sale of your c++. I hope this appropriate? 
 Original Message 
From: George Reenstra 
To: Larry 
Sent: Dec 10, 2009 9:42 AM 
Subject: RE: News 

Unless there is another buy in the deal I doubt they will do it since 
they would then actually lose a deal. I know the price for the 
replacement is key and that is what I am trying to get. 

George Reenstra 
Aircraft Services Group Inc 
300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 
Mahwah, NJ 07430 
Tel 
Fax 

----Ori inal Messa 
From: [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2009 9:45 AM 
To: George Reenstra 
Subject: Re: News 

Personally I think it is based on price of next c++ or just not have the 
purchase claus in there 
 Original Message 
From: George Reenstra 
To: Larry 
Sent: Dec 10, 2009 9:37 AM 
Subject: RE: News 

Ok please let me know 

George Reenstra 
Aircraft Services Group Inc 
300 Corporate Drive, Suite 2 
Mahwah, NJ 07430 
Tel 

EFTA00743408



Fa, 

 Original Messa e 
From: [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2009 8:38 AM 
To: George Reenstra 
Subject: News 

FYI, Je didn't respond to my email, so I have no idea of his position at 
this time., 
Larry 
Sent from my BlacicBerry(r) wireless handheld 

Sent from my BlacicBerry(r) wireless handheld 

Sent from my BlackBerry® wireless handheld 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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