
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.corn> 

To: Emad Hanna • ca 
Subject: Re: FW: Zorro Fountain Install 

Date: Thu, 24 Dec 2009 17:38:42 +0000 

sorry , it can;t be 13k for demo. only , there is virtually nothing there 

On Wed, Dec 23, 2009 at 10:29 AM, Emad Hanna cza. wrote: 

Jeffery, 

Below is correspondence from you, Brice and Gary regarding the Zorro Fountain. 

I am unclear as to what the total cost of this project will be and I don't have any budget set up for this project. 

It is not clear to me if you have been informed of what the potential cost could be. 

Brice has submitted a request to pay $ 13,087.20 for the demo work going on right now. 

Rich needs your approval to wire the funds. 

Please advise 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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From: Gary Kerney [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2009 5:43 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Fwd: Zorro Fountain Install 

Attached is Jeffrey approval for Brice to make. The call 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Brice Gordon
Date: December 22, 2009 6:34:13 PM EST 
To: Gary Kerney
Subject: FW: Zorro Fountain Install 

Hi there 
Yes all info was forward to JEE, even the note from you agreeing with my approach 
His reply is below. 
This was forwarded to Emad yesterday 
I made the call to have it done 
The first stage is complete and now we need to pay them 
Photo's have been forwarded to JEE weeks ago!!! 
Thx Brice 

----- Forwarded Message 
From: J Epstein <I 
Date: Wed, 30 Sep 2009 08:43:20 -0400 
To: Brice Gordon. 
Subject: Re: Zorro Fountain Install 

your call. 

On Wed, Sep 30, 2009 at 5:49 AM, Brice Gordon wrote: 

Winter, last frost ZR mid to end may, start June 2010 would meaning completion by end of July to Mid August. 
concrete slab needs 28days to cure 
Only access to area is through front doors, which would mean building a ramp over floor etc, sealing hall area off. 
Just thought you would like to have this done before your return to Zorro 

Maybe Gary K needs to visit Ranch, to review , stucco, water, etc? 

On 9/29/09 10:57 AM, "J Epstein" <jeevacation@gtriail.com <littp://jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote: 

i seee no reason to break it up 

On The, Sep 29, 2009 at 8:37 AM, Brice Gordon > wrote: 
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To JEE 

Resubmitting estimate for the fountain installation at Zorro Ranch. Would 
recommend that we remove existing fountain and form base this year, Then in 
the Spring erect new fountain. 

For your consideration 

Brice 

************************************************* ********** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 

----- End of Forwarded Message 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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