
From: "Rich Kahn" czMI > 

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: Maguire 

Date: Wed, 30 Dec 2009 17:31:49 +0000 

Attachments: Maguire_Invoice_dated_12-3-09.pdf; Maguireinvoice_dated_11-5-09.pdf 

Attached are two Maguire invoices totaling 30,380 that Gary has approved. 
Seeking approval to pay as it is above Gary limit of $25,000. 
Thank you 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
PO Box 400 
New York, NY 10150 

 Original Message 
From: Gary Kerney [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2009 4:32 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Maguire 

Approved for both. Gary 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 22, 2009, at 4:27 PM, "Rich Kahn" ‹ > 
wrote: 

> Have you reviewed attached invoice? 

> • In addition, the previous invoice in the amount of 16,195 is still 
> open. 

> Please advise if ok to pay current and previous invoices? 

> • Thank you 

> • Rich Kahn 

> • HBRK Associates Inc. 

> • PO Box 400 

> • New York, NY 10150 
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> 
> 
> <Maguire Invoice dated 12-3-09.pdf> 
> <Maguire Invoice dated 11-5-09.pdf> 
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