
From: Jeevacation leevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Emad Hanna <ehanna@hbrkassociates.com> 

Subject: Re: Lady K Marine Fenders 

Date: Mon, 01 Mar 2010 16:59:28 +0000 

Aren't they in the stores 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 1, 2010, at 11:57 AM, "Emad Hanna" <ehanna@hbrkassociates.com> wrote: 

Jeffery, 

I have a request from Brice which I priced out for 12 fenders for Lady K for LSJ and AYH 6 fenders for each 
location and the $ 10,800 purchase cost is the best price we have located. 

It will take 4 to 8 weeks fro them to be produced. 

Please provide your approval for payment so that we can get these produced. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

Ph (646) 862-4815 

Fax (646) 350-0221 

ehanna@hbrkassociates.com 
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