
From: "Rich Kahn"  

To: "Jeffrey Epstein" -4 

Subject: FW: Antilles School --
Date: Tue, 22 Jun 2010 18:57:00 +0000 

Attachments: Antilles School_ - pdf _ 

Just received Carlos education bill in the amount of $7,070 for 2010-2011 annual tuition. 

Confirming that it is ok to pay from JEE personal account as discussed. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 646-862-4811 

fax 646-350-0954 

cell 

From: ann rodriquez [mailto 
Sent: Monday, June 21, 2010 11:03 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Antilles School --

as Carlos requested... 

Ann R. :-) 

EFTA00747035


