
From: "Rich Kahn'

To: "Jeevacation" <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: re: MC2 

Date: Wed, 23 Jun 2010 18:30:10 +0000 

They just paid 10k on credit line and loan balance is 824,598.24 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Dominique [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2010 2:09 PM 
To: jeff@mc2mm.com; Rich Kahn 
Subject: RE: updates 

The balance on the loan as of today is $824,598.24 

Dominique Nameche 

MC2 

From: Jeff Fuller [mailtouppi. 
Sent: Wednesday, June , 
To: 'Rich Kahn' 
Cc: 
Subject: RE: updates 

We are trying diligently to do 20k per month but due to cash flow we cannot always do it at once and have to do 
multiple payments. 

EFTA00747399



From: Rich Kahn [mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2010 12:09 PM 
To: jeff@mc2mm.com 
Subject: RE: updates 

Thanks for the update 

Once I receive statement and review we can go over any questions you have. 

I saw email with 10,000 pay down. Is that a portion of 20,000 per month or will this month be different 

Thanks 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cel 

From: Jeff Fuller [mailto 
Sent: Friday, June 18, 2010 10:04 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: 'Carol Rowbo' 
Subject: RE: updates 

I should have a mid year statement for you after the 4th of July. Things are going good. Actually, I am far 
from cool in Florida it is hotter than hell. I have rarely spent this much time here in the Summer. Probably will 
head to NY for spell in July and may actually want to seek your advice in a couple things moving forward. 

Best, 

EFTA00747400



Jeff 

From: Rich Kahn [maitto 
Sent: Thursday, June 17,
To: jeff@mc2mm.com 
Subject: re: updates 

Hope you are well and staying cool in FL 

Any updates on business 

Thanks 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

EFTA00747401


