
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: George Reenstra 
Cc: lvjet <LVJET@aol.com> 

Subject: Re. C+4-/D Model 
Date: The, 30 Mar 2010 20:54:44 +0000 

no the larry d model is not 12.4.. i have no trouble wiring the amount tomorrow , but u still do not have a 
detailed breakdown of the d„ this is a twelve day old request. 

On Tue, Mar 30, 2010 at 4:32 PM, George Reenstra wrote: 
I have been on the phone with Sikorsky. If I read all of the e-mails correctly you will do the deal at $24.4 million for the 
C++ and D Model. The numbers break out: the C++ is $12 million; the D is $12.4 million. The D will be configured as 
outlined in Larry's e-mail of Monday, March 24, to Marc Poland. Additionally, you will sell 750 if my buyer comes to the 
table for $12.3 million to you. I will disclose any commissions being paid beyond the $100,000 you agreed to pay me and 
if I sell it directly, there will be no other commissions. But right now there may be another broker in the deal. 

Lastly, because we have no signed contracts, and I think everyone needs to take a breath here, you need to wire the 
deposit of $10 million to Sikorsky. It is fully refundable by April 30, 2010 if we cannot finalize the spec and produce firm 
contracts. 

I've gone out on a limb here but if you give me your word we are going forward based on the above, I will get Marc to 
produce a document supporting everything I have given you. You know the key is the monies need to be with Sikorsky by 
close of business tomorrow. 

George Reenstra 
Aircraft Services Group, Inc. 
300 Corporate Drive. Suite 2 
Mahwah, NJ 07430 
Telephone: 
Fax: 
E-Mail 
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