From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com>

To: lana zakocel <
Subject: Re:
Date: Sat, 10 Apr 2010 11:01:47 +0000

what jobs have you had? are you putting money in your pocket?

On Sat, Apr 10, 2010 at 6:01 AM, lana zakocela <[ GG - ot

Yesterday 1 feel up all documents and forms. It was so much. If my agent from Karin would not help me, 1
would never be able to do it by myself. I have to bring so many copies of all the different forms and

documents...So hopefully 1 will have everything correct, 1 was very stressful about that .

So as long as i get visa,1 choose the date with the agency,because 1 still have some good jobs coming up.

[ can not wait when 1 will have already the date for going to NY.
big big kiss and hug ;)

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
To: 2na <

Sent: Fri, 9 April, 2010 16:45:55

Subject:

one more week
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The information contained 1n this communication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation( gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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