
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Harry Beller <1 

Subject: Re: Epstein Bill 
Date: Thu, 14 May 2009 18:18:48 +0000 

DID DARREN APPROVE? 

On Thu, May 14, 2009 at 2:13 PM, Harry Beller cza wrote: 

Jeffrey 

This is what I plan to send. Is this ok with you? 

Harry 

Sheryl 

Your self serving statements are without any merit. You have chosen to ignore your legal responsibility and 

and have yet to provide a basis for holding onto clients funds to offset an amount in dispute. 

Harry 

From: Sheryl E. Reich [mailto 
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2009 1:12 PM 
To: Harry Beller 
Subject: Epstein Bill 

Dear Mr. Beller - Please be advised that I expect that the amount of $50,000 will be 
wired by Friday in further payment of the credit Mr. Epstein has with the firm. After 
this payment, the amount of $28,373.54 remains outstanding. I will advise you as to 
when additional payment can be expected. 
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Sheryl E. Reich, Esq. 

Gerald B. Lefcourt, P.C. 

148 East 78 Street 

New York, N.Y. 10075 

(212) 737-0400 

(212) 988-0192 

www.Lefcourtlaw.com 
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